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As I sign up to become a member of a club, 
I agree to the Terms and Conditions of that 
membership as outlined by the Clubs 
Membership policy. This connects me to 
any Club specific policies around 
behaviour, my membership rights and 
obligations etc
The benefits of this membership include 
use of the club, its courts, coaching and 
other things outlined based on your 
membership type

INDIVIDUALMY DATA MY MEMBERSHIP

When I join the club as a member, I provide 
it personal information as requested. This 
data is managed/stored by the clubs third 

party MMS provider and covered by the 
providers Data Privacy Policy.

The Clubs own privacy policy should also 
be displayed to the individual. 

In the terms of service that my Club has 
agreed to with the MMS Vendor, it states 
that the data collected on Individuals can 

be shared with the National body and other 
relevant parties. As an Individual, I have the 
ability to ‘opt out’ of communications via my 

login to the Clubs MMS provider. 

The Tennis NZ regulations outline the 
minimum data points we required from 

MMS Vendors and that specific set of data 
is pulled into the national database. There 
may be other data points collected by the 

club that are not pulled.

At sign up to the club membership, I am 
also agreeing to become a non-voting 
member of TNZ. This connects me to 
national membership policies such as the 
TPPP and Code of Conduct.
The benefits of this TNZ membership 
include preferential access to tournaments 
and competitions, offers on events and 
equipment eg, Davis Cup and ASB Classic, 
offers on commercial partners etc. 

Data stored in the National Database 
(Microsoft Dynamics platform) is protected 

by TNZ Data Privacy (in accordance with 
NZ Privacy Act 2020) and Management 

Policies. This extends to its use/sharing and 
viewing via the TNZ Portal by 

Clubs/RTOs/LTPS and those users granted 
access to it. 

At sign up to the club membership, I am 
also agreeing to become a non-voting 
member of the relevant LTP/RTO. This 
connects me to any RTO/LTP specific 
membership policies.
The benefits of this RTO/LTP membership 
include use of regional facilities, 
preferential access to tournaments and 
competitions, offers on regional specific 
events (eg Tennis Auckland members 
offers to ASB Classic)
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